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If you're agreeing that itis not exempt, then, you are required to
provide it to me in whatever form | requestit. Like e.g. redacted
bills from your attorneys.

Since you seem to have admitted that the information is not exempt,
please provide it immediately via these bills.

thanks,

OnThu, May 4,2017, at 05:54 PM, Estela Lopez wrote:

In responseto your email of April 25, the information regarding how much
CCEA paid forlegal representationinthe of the Catholic Worker
lawsuit will be m_lu:i,d in the March5 n t forVendor Transaction
Reports.

Cordially,
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Thanks for rethinking this,

On Wed, Apr 19, 2017, at 1(:25 AM, Estela Lopez wrote:
Pursuant to the Stipulated Judgment in LACW et al. v. Downtown
Industrial District BID et al. (2:14-cv-07344-PSG-AJW), the court has
retained jurisdiction for an additional four years. Thus, until the
matteris finished, we believe that the case remains “pending” and the
requested documents remain privileged.

Cordially,

Estela Lopez

Downtown Industrial District BID
7125 Crocker St.

Los Angeles, CA 90021
213-228-8484
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